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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR:

TIME &

DATE:

  

ITEM NO.

32 each UNIT

PRICE 715.00 625.00 800.00 1,000.00 No Bid

1. TOTAL 22,880.00 20,000.00 25,600.00 32,000.00

32 each UNIT

PRICE 680.00 625.00 800.00 1,000.00 No Bid

2 TOTAL 21,760.00 20,000.00 25,600.00 32,000.00

20 each UNIT

PRICE 325.00 400.00 400.00 400.00 No Bid

3 TOTAL 6,500.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 8,000.00

20 each UNIT

PRICE 300.00 400.00 400.00 500.00 No Bid

4 TOTAL 6,000.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 10,000.00

30 each UNIT

PRICE 50.00 200.00 200.00 200.00 No Bid

5 TOTAL 1,500.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00

30 each UNIT

PRICE 50.00 200.00 200.00 250.00 No Bid

6 TOTAL 1,500.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 7,500.00

*

60,140.00 68,000.00 79,200.00 95,500.00 No Bid

60,140.00

60,140.00

60,140.00

Net Net 10.0% Net

30 days 30 days 15 Days 30 days

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:  

Analytical Water & Wastewater Services Ensolve Demandstar

Anatek Labs - Spokane Envirodyne Laboratories SAWS Website

Aqua-Tech Laboratories Environmental Monitoring Laboratories

Bio-Aquatic Testing Inc. Eurofins Eaton Analytical

Bio-Chem Laboratories Microbiological Labs

Biotox Microbiology Specialist Incorporated

Compco Analytical Pace Analytical

Element Materials Technology Houston PDC Laboratories

Unity Lab Services Test America

Bio-Analytical Laboratories EA Engineering, Science, and Technology, Inc. PBC.

Parameters: Pimephales promelas

Parameters: Pimephales promelas

Parameters: Ceriodaphnia dubia

Method: 7 day Chronic

Date of Award through June 30, 2018

3:00 p.m. 6/20/2017

Method:48 hours Static Renewal

Annual Contract for Biomonitoring Analytical Services

Analytical Services

DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Parameters:  Daphnia pulex
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Method: 7 day Chronic

GRAND TOTAL

Method:24 hours Static Acute Screen

Method:24 hours Static Acute Screen

Method:48 hours Static Renewal

Extension 2

Terms

Extension 3
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Parameters: Pimephales promelas

Delivery 

Parameters: Daphnia pulex

Extension 1
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